
 

Michael Bank: 
It's really taken a catalyst like the COVID for a lot of these ins9tu9ons to take more of like an 
introspec9ve look at their technology. 

James Robert Lay: 
Gree9ngs and hello. I am James Robert Lay and welcome to the 56 episode of the Banking on Digital 
Growth podcast. Today's episode is part of the Exponen9al Insight Series, and I'm excited to welcome 
Michael Bank and Seth Fenster to the show. Michael and Seth are co founders of Blip and they are doing 
great work to empower posi9ve financial health for people. Welcome to the show, gentlemen. 

Michael Bank: 
Thank you for having us. 

Seth Fenster: 
Thank you for having us. 

James Robert Lay: 
You know, this is going to be fun. This is the first 9me that I've had two people on the show at once. And 
so I know you guys are going to add a lot to the conversa9on and now that we're 55 episodes in. And 
when we look back and we reflect on this great century, that we'll call 2020, and we're looking ahead 
now to 2021. I just want to start the dialogue and the discussion around, what are you most energized 
about whether that be personally or professionally? 

Michael Bank: 
Sure. [inaudible 00:01:58] certainly start off on that ques9on. From our perspec9ve with our company 
Blip, we really believe that consumers can't effec9vely save, spend or invest without first taking care of 
their bills. And so that's those a lot towards the larger purpose on what we're focusing on. And so the 
mission around Blip is really to empower posi9ve financial health, as you alluded to in your introduc9on 
there. And so we really are doing what we do because we want to really address the lack of help and the 
lack of educa9on around financial management that has really affected us. And so that's what we're 
excited about for the future. And so Blip really helps look at finances in more of a forward or, or an 
upcoming way, rather than looking at historical trends. And so that's really where we think there's going 
to be addi9onal value to help people with their financial health and financial wellness. 

James Robert Lay: 
I really like that perspec9ve, Blip is future focus versus being rooted. We tradi9onally think about 
financial services it's historically focused or reviewing past transac9ons. And that's very hard because it's 
a lot of... when I think about and coach financial brand leaders, it's so easy to get stuck in the present 
moment, making decisions that were informed by the past, where if we look in this post COVID world, 
par9cularly from financial services, how quickly things are changing and evolving, we look at even from a 
consumer standpoint, financial stress, those levels are out the roof right now. So I like ge_ng ahead of 
the problem before the problem even exists. Is that a fair summary of the perspec9ve of Blip? 

Michael Bank: 
Yeah, absolutely. Seth, sorry go ahead. 



 

Seth Fenster: 
No. I was just going to say for sure. And I again what excites me and... This has been a tough year for 
everyone, it goes without saying, but at the same 9me we've seen so many changes happening so much 
quicker than we an9cipated, like the 9melines of digital adop9on really obviously in financial services, 
but just across the board in every industry are just accelerated by even decades. I'm personally really 
invigorated about that because we're merging at this 9me where really everyone is just like, "How do we 
make this work now digitally?" It's just like a completely different world right now. 

Seth Fenster: 
And, like Mike was saying, it's really about bringing in that digital point of view to the forward-looking 
aspects of financial management and James, you alluded to it before, everything has really been about 
historical spending and promp9ng your user with the no9fica9on that they spent X amount of dollars on 
God knows what in the last month, the last year. And that can be really helpful, but it really just seems 
more like budge9ng and just 9me and 9me again people have shown that they don't really care about 
budge9ng, but they do care about the bills they have due the next month and the ones aeer that. And so 
that's really where we're focusing. 

James Robert Lay: 
I love that perspec9ve, Seth. Let's talk about that, why is budge9ng painful? Why is budge9ng hard? It's 
one of those things I think back... and to your point the changes that we've seen in digital, I've been in 
the space almost 20 years now, and I've never seen this type of accelera9on and it's very exci9ng, but it 
can also be very scary for those as well who have made a career, but I want to talk specifically about 
budge9ng and the challenges of budge9ng for people. Why is it painful? 

Seth Fenster: 
I just think people don't... maybe for one, as a culture and as a society, we tend to be very spending 
consump9on-based market in the US and if you really looked at maybe what you should be spending 
versus what you shouldn't be spending it on, maybe I would say it's probably that people don't want to 
know that they're doing something that maybe isn't in their best interest and that they really care about 
what they spent on. 

Seth Fenster: 
They just care about where they're going and they don't want to go through the whole process of saying, 
"I have this much coming in and I can spend it on this, this and that." And the other layer is, it's not really 
easy to do that. And so maybe in an ideal situa9on, a budget is great, but by calling it a budget, you think 
about si_ng down and like in old way of balancing a checkbook and running through all your 
statements, and no one wants to do that. 

Seth Fenster: 
And if said to them, "This is an automated system that really budgets for you because in essence your 
budget is your bills," They would say, "This is great." You just can't call it a budge9ng. You'd have to call it 
managing your finances, but it's one and the same. 

Michael Bank: 
Yeah, I would agree with that point and just to echo it. I think that... and this is again where James 
Robert was bringing up previously, but a lot of it around the historical trends, if, if I'm budge9ng off of 
what I've already done, it's just not as helpful to me on a go forward basis. And so when we're taking a 



 

forward look at users upcoming bills, that's really where we're able to provide more proac9ve financial 
advice around making posi9ve changes rather than retroac9vely saying, "Oh, I messed that up," or, "I 
should've done this. Instead of that.' It's catching it proac9vely and being able to help people make 
smarter decisions before they've actually made those decisions. 

James Robert Lay: 
The way that I hear you guys dis9lling this, I think a lot about healthcare and this like the trip to the 
doctor. No one wants to go to the doctor because it's painful and it takes 9me. Even there was a report 
by Viacom that specific and talking about financial services. This was a couple of years ago that said 
people would rather go to the den9st, than to go visit their financial ins9tu9on. And that's, that's a 
pregy painful statement right there. But I think too healthcare is star9ng to transform the way that 
they're posi9oning themselves. Because they're talking about preventa9ve medicine, ge_ng ahead of 
the problems before the problems even exists. And so when we look at this from the lens of financial 
services, that's why I appreciate, the work that you're doing. And budgets, they're hard, they're scary, 
they're painful. Let's talk about transforming that perspec9ve through the work that you're doing at Blip. 

Michael Bank: 
Yeah. We think a lot about this topic because we're really a digital organiza9on from the ground up, but 
we're working a lot with companies that do digital. And that's important dis9nc9on. And so it's really 
about leading the organiza9on to the problem. And the healthcare analogy is a good analogy. And we 
have seen a lot of changes around digital, especially in the banking space, like you said in a post COVID 
world. But it's really taken a catalyst like the COVID, for a lot of these ins9tu9ons to take more of like an 
introspec9ve look at their technology. But I think that they really are ac9vely thinking about ways to 
improve their experiences for customers just in the same way in the healthcare side, they're ac9vely 
trying to do that as well. 

James Robert Lay: 
Well, let's talk about that experiences par9cularly when we look at digital experiences. Digital 
experiences are nothing more than well-defined systems and processes that have been defined, applied 
and op9mized over a period of 9me resul9ng in one of two things, a posi9ve emo9on or a nega9ve 
emo9on. And when we look at the systems and processes, tradi9onally of bill pay that an incumbent 
financial brand bank credit might bring to market, what are some of the challenges that those tradi9onal 
systems might present either internally for the financial brand, but also externally for the end user or the 
consumer? 

Seth Fenster: 
Yeah, I would say first and foremost, these legacy bill pay systems are really expensive and they primarily 
run on ACH transfers and wri9ng checks on the customer's behalf. And so that's an expensive way to pay 
a bill for the actual financial brand itself. But it doesn't really gel with the more digitally na9ve consumer 
who's expec9ng instant no9fica9on that their payment was made or that they want a flexible op9on to 
use a card. [inaudible 00:10:42] cards, debit and credit are very popular. 

Seth Fenster: 
And so like right now that whole system of how you really going to pay a bill, even in this situa9on where 
you can see it digitally, you s9ll have to go and manually submit the payment either through your bank's 
bill pay, which we know isn't really ge_ng a ton of use or just managing an average of a seven bills a 
month per person. So you got to seven different websites at seven different 9mes during your busy life 
each month and make those payments. Like it's a lot of things fall through the cracks. 



 

James Robert Lay: 
Which by the way, those websites are not always mobile op9mized and I'm calling out my city 
municipality with their water bill. So- 

Michael Bank: 
That's definitely true. But if you think about it, like Seth just men9oned, the average number of bills is 
seven per month. And what's interes9ng is that about 75% of those bills are actually paid on biller 
websites. And most of these biller websites are really not op9mized to be user-friendly. It takes me like 
10 minutes just to pay my u9lity bill. 

Michael Bank: 
And this is in its current form, what people are considering the beger approach than using the 
tradi9onal bank bill pay model. So that's how you know up to the 15 billion bills that are being paid 
annually, that this is the best approach people are taking and it's s9ll subpar asset. So that's where again, 
if we can figure out a way, which is what we're trying to accomplish obviously with Blip, to really improve 
that experience from the ground up, it's really going to take everything to the next level. And it's really 
going to enable the financial ins9tu9ons to bring customers back to the organiza9ons because they're 
predominantly not paying bills through the banks and credit unions currently. 

James Robert Lay: 
If we get people to come back and to pay through the bank, to pay through their credit union, that 
reinforces once again, that posi9ve rela9onship, because you're simplifying the complexi9es of my life. 
You're helping me to stop losing this valuable 9me and to have this annoying frustra9on because as a 
consumer, my expecta9on is being set and really met by GAFA: Google, Amazon, Facebook, Apple, and 
even on the payments front, Zelle has done or even Venmo. It's that simplicity of being able to move 
money from A to B, peer to peer, person to person. Even for me with four kids, it's a requirement that 
my babysigers have either a Zelle or Venmo account so that I don't have to come home at midnight and 
have to stop by some shady ATM and pull out some cash. I'd rather just pay them on the way home and 
life is good and we go on. So no, I really get where you're coming from. 

Michael Bank: 
Yeah, no, that's exactly right. 

Seth Fenster: 
It's all about opportunity. And like Mike men9oned it, there's 15.4 billion bills paid every year and that's 
about 488 a second. And that each one of those is a unique opportunity for a financial brand to make an 
impact with their customer. Because we talk a lot internally about a world where your bank says to you, 
"We see that you have this credit card bill and it happens to be at a different financial ins9tu9on. And 
your interest rate is really high on that and you've been carrying a balance. why don't you think about 
doing a balance transfer and bringing that into our ins9tu9on and it'll save you an over9me and just 
showing you in a simple mobile app, like how much in the dollar amount of savings would be?" 

Seth Fenster: 
And just that is so powerful. And like that's a scenario where one, the customer is benefi9ng from saving 
money, for sure. But it's also a touch point with an ins9tu9on who they have some rela9onship with, but 
not a main one at this 9me. And that ins9tu9on is demonstra9ng to that customer that they have their 
back even though they're not currently their customer for this product, but they're s9ll looking out for 



 

them. And so, yeah, it's maybe a ligle bit of a cross sell, but it's really more of a, like, "I'm advoca9ng for 
you," and that's what that's missing. 

James Robert Lay: 
Yes. And I would actually push back on the idea that that's a cross sell, that's actually a methodology that 
I teach called helping first, it's been haven a methodology, it's a mantra, help first, sell second. Because 
what you're doing is you're iden9fying where people are losing money and people are more likely to take 
ac9on to avoid a loss and change their behavior to modify their behavior. Then they are to achieve. So if 
you can posi9on that say, "Hey, we've iden9fied how you can stop losing $1,000 in this high interest 
credit card. Click here." And so it really is that that mantra of help first, sell second being applied through 
the context of digital. And I would assume that this would work as well, not only just for credit card, but 
any other opportuni9es, whether that be auto, mortgage... Whatever reoccurring payments are. Is that 
correct? 

Seth Fenster: 
Absolutely. 

Michael Bank: 
Yeah that's exactly. It could even be expanded beyond just hacking products as well. If you're fed up with 
your cable provider as an example, there was no reason, again, because of the data we have on our 
billing informa9on, that again, we couldn't help customers proac9vely look at well, what other offers are 
available to them to be able to, again, to your point, save them money. 

James Robert Lay: 
I could see just the amazing amount of opportunity to provide that financial educa9on to net savings. It 
comes back to the whole purpose of what you guys are talking. It's empowerment, because I'm 
empowering you to make even beger decisions. Decisions that you might not even know are available, 
or you might not even be aware. So you're providing clarity into the unknown opportuni9es for the 
consumer. I want to dig into another common pain point, because I'm, I'm just ge_ng excited speaking 
from my lens of, of being a consumer, let's talk about those annoying reoccurring transac9ons. 

James Robert Lay: 
Maybe 10, 12 bucks a month. We live in a subscrip9on economy. I've got my YouTube subscrip9on, my 
Spo9fy subscrip9on, my Nemlix subscrip9on, which by the way, we canceled that a couple of months 
ago. Because I was like just done. We're done with Nemlix. And it was, for me personally, it was the fact 
of way too much content, way too many op9ons, way too much choice to where I found that if we sat 
down to watch something, it was the paradox of choice applied. Really, my wife and I were like, "What 
are we going to watch? I don't know, what do you want to watch." And it was like this whole and I was 
like, "You know what? We're not ge_ng any value." 

Seth Fenster: 
[crosstalk 00:17:22] to figure out what to watch, it's terrible. 

Michael Bank: 
Also men9on, they've subtly con9nued to up that subscrip9on fee in the bathroom. 



 

Seth Fenster: 
Which I'm really glad you brought up because another amazingly exci9ng opportunity with all of this is 
that when Nemlix decides to raise the rates, when your cable company raises your rates, you're out of 
luck. There's nothing, there's nothing you can do. You can go cancel, but it means nothing to them. But if 
everyone is able to collec9vely say, "We don't want this and we're not just going to complain on Twiger, 
we're all going to cancel that once." 100,0000 cancella9ons coming from one plamorm, it's aggrega9ng 
these bills, might get a discount collec9vely. And so there's some layers of not just financial advice, but 
also more empowerment beyond just the advice of individual, but to act as a collec9ve. I think that's 
extremely exci9ng. 

James Robert Lay: 
Yeah. You're providing that, once again that knowledge, that clarity, that awareness. And they are the 
annoying pain points that it might be more painful to stop that behavior to like... And I can think of some 
subscrip9ons that I've had over the years to where it's like, "Here's that bill again. It's only like 12 bucks a 
month. I'm just going to let it ride and I'll come back next month. There it is again." And because it's 
more work for me to go out and cancel that subscrip9on than at least in my mind to more work to where 
if you're bringing that awareness to the fold, it's really transforma9ve. Because that 12 bucks, I mean 
that's $144 over the course of a year. And they add up, they start to mul9ply. 

Seth Fenster: 
You probably don't no9ce you have that subscrip9on un9l they've charged your card for that month. And 
good luck trying to get them to give you that money back. Sure you can cancel for the next month, but 
[crosstalk 00:19:03] before the charge went through. 

James Robert Lay: 
They are not going to give it back, exactly. So we've already iden9fied two major opportuni9es from the 
consumer standpoint, an opportunity from the financial brand to just keep people coming back and then 
really a second opportunity as well is to get that help first, sell second, providing, "Hey, here's a 
recommenda9on that can help you stop losing money. Just something to think about something to 
consider." What other opportuni9es are available for either the financial brands or the consumer for 
financial brands to bring to consumers with this? 

Seth Fenster: 
It really comes down as all really related to the two major ones, because those are really the overarching 
themes of like, how do we inject proac9ve elements into your financial life? I would say it's really just 
more broadly, like what can we do when you're not really sure how to do it yourself and how do we 
facilitate your doing it so that it doesn't really feel like you're doing anything to make your life beger? It's 
like, how do we let you manage your finances in a way that's like a controlled autopilot? 

James Robert Lay: 
Well all of the best products plamorms, apps that we use, feel like second nature. They don't feel like any 
more work. I love the analogy of just autopilot because it does make life more simple. It does make life 
feel even beger. So let's role play for a second. I'm a financial brand leader. I'm a CEO, I'm a COO, I'm a 
Chief Digital Officer. What are some of the roadblocks that you might be bumping up against right now? 
And how are you helping to educate and empower those leaders to overcome what I would just call 
limi9ng beliefs or they're stuck either in the circle of chaos that I write about in my book or what I'm 
really star9ng to... and this is for my next book, Banking on Change, but stuck in what I call the cave of 
complacency? What are ways that you can educate and empower financial brand leaders that, "Hey, 



 

there's an even beger way to empower and educate your account holders by just looking at this one 
simple behavior modifica9on with bill pay." 

Seth Fenster: 
Yes it's a great ques9on. And it really comes down to educa9ng these financial brand leaders on how 
they can go and do this. And when you started talking to them about the use cases and the poten9al of 
ge_ng access to this type of data and these customer experiences, they love it. Like there's no reason 
not to love it. But it's a challenge because by design, a lot of these ins9tu9ons are slow moving and a lot 
of them are dealing with technology vendors that they don't have a lot of leverage over. And so what 
we've really done internally is try and build a system that like an infrastructure layer, but also out of the 
box customer experience ready soeware that they can use to really make it as easy as possible to offer 
this either. 

Seth Fenster: 
If they want to spin up a kind of like a bill pay app separately from their core digital banking stack or if 
they wanted more deeply integrated. Our job is to not just tell them, but show them that they actually 
can do it. And I think it goes back to our point about where the digital adop9on is accelerated. These are 
conversa9ons that would probably have gone a lot differently even a year ago. And so it's really more 
about like, how do we take this and get it to work now and how fast and what's involved in doing it? And 
so it comes down to not just educa9ng them on the opportunity, but demonstra9ng how easy it can be 
to make it work and make it happen. 

James Robert Lay: 
That's a great point. So let's talk about value crea9on. You've been in the market, you've got some 
valida9on. What has been some of the feedback or the value that you've created for the end user, for 
the consumer? 

Michael Bank: 
Yeah. That's a good ques9on. So we're currently in the process of doing a beta rollout. And so we've 
been able to collect a lot of valuable feedback from the users that are actually tes9ng out the product. 
And a lot of the feedback that we're ge_ng is things that we have as we thought that we would get. But 
obviously then we're ge_ng valuable feedback that was thought about and ways to use the product or 
consume the product, not necessarily even the way that we ini9ally intended it. And so, a lot of the 
posi9ve feedback we're ge_ng is around the aggregated nature of the product. Being able to pull all 
your billers into one convenient loca9on is been really important to our end users, because like we 
talking about before, they're typically going out to each of the biller websites individually. So that's been 
really invaluable feedback to us. 

Michael Bank: 
And then another component of the feedback that we're receiving from the beta tasks beyond just the 
user experience of aggrava9on, is largely around the onboarding flow, because that's really important as 
well. Typically, the banks and credit unions, if they're using a bill pay provider, user needs to add their 
card number, their payee address informa9on, and even finding, "What is my account number?" Is even 
a difficult task. And so you just give up on it. And so we're quickly and easily able to get people set up 
with all the billers. We're able to look at your transac9on history to [inaudible 00:24:31] billers that 
should be added. And so again, it's this proac9ve nature that people are really enjoying and giving us 
great feedback about what we have so far. 



 

James Robert Lay: 
Having done at this point, well, over 1,000 different digital secret shopping studies for financial brands, I 
got to tell you that pain point of onboarding, of having to go and find those... Par9cularly if you have a 
new account holder, and I'm talking like onboarding to a financial brand, a bank or credit union, acquires 
a new deposit account holder, and they're wan9ng to help bring all of the accounts over to new FI, 
there's a lot of fric9on 9ed to that experience even now, because I have to go and find all of those 
statements. And so, one of the recommenda9ons that I've made over the years for those in our program 
is, let's just put together some type of a concierge service to where I show up and I dump my 10, 12 
different statements that I get. And then you can do all that work for me because it's work. And I love 
how you're addressing that to remove the fric9on to the very common pain points in people's lives. 

Seth Fenster: 
One of the other more powerful aspects of the feedback we've gogen, was around the idea that some of 
the beta testers weren't en9rely sure why they were seeing a bunch of different balances for their credit 
card bill that they linked from the app. And one in par9cular reached out to me and they asked, "I think 
this might be wrong. It doesn't line up with what I'm seeing in the bank's app." And we explained like, 
we're actually showing you the current balance, the minimum balance and the statement balance. And 
that was something that this par9cular beta tester hadn't really encountered before and even texted me 
and was like, "I just didn't realize that it worked like that." 

Seth Fenster: 
And so they were just paying their current balance every month, which was not bad behavior with a 
credit card. But, that's extra that they could've saved it for something else for same month. And so it was 
that educa9onal aspect of seeing the bills like this is actually really helpful and really powerful. And so 
that's been a really promising feedback as well. 

Michael Bank: 
One thing I would just add on to that point again, around providing data in just a clean and simple 
consumable format that gives people the informa9on that they really need, is we've seen a lot of people 
will just go into, not to name any specific bank, but they'll go into a bank app or website and look at what 
their current checking account balances and think that that's their safe to spend amount. "This is the 
money that I've got in my account. So I'm good to go." And, you know, just as like an example, if 
somebody has $400 in their checking account, when they go out and buy a TV for $300, they think great 
about $100 leeover where they're not actually thinking about, again, that proac9ve upcoming nature of 
bills they have throughout the rest of the month. 

Michael Bank: 
And very quickly then by the end of the month, they're actually in the red. And so we visually show what 
your current balance is, but then show what those upcoming bills are due. And then we'll basically minus 
those two numbers to give you almost a leeover safe to spend amount. And so we've got a lot of good 
feedback on, on people actually looking at that number as opposed to the current balance number in 
gaining a beger understanding of the finances. 

James Robert Lay: 
The way that you're describing that I almost see, Blip as being the financial crystal ball to foresee the 
future. Once again, now we've come full circle with this conversa9on, what a great one it has been to 
help prevent people from ge_ng into trouble before that trouble presents itself. As we look ahead to a 



 

whole new year full of opportunity in 2021, what is one piece of advice or what is one recommenda9on 
that you might have for financial brand leaders in the banking space or in the credit industry? 

Michael Bank: 
Seth feel free to obviously jump in here, but I would say, and really embrace the change. And again, 
COVID is obviously pandemic and has been terrible for many people, but that it has, again, like we talked 
about in the very beginning of this conversa9on, opened the eyes of people and ins9tu9ons that say, 
"Well, if people aren't going to be coming into our branch, what are we actually doing?" And so it's 
taking that introspec9ve look. So it's the second half... or even the first half of 2020 people have started 
doing, but roll with the punches of changes that are coming. 

Michael Bank: 
And don't be afraid to make these changes because consumers are experiencing a lot of change with 
other aspects of their lives. Being able to quickly buy something on the internet and it arrives several 
hours later is the experience that people have come to expect from other aspects of the library. Even 
talking about like the Nemlix is where the content is just right there. And so people have come to expect 
the same from their banking experience. And it's just not really there yet. So I would say don't be afraid 
to make these changes. They might seem scary, but it's something that is moving the ball forward from a 
digital perspec9ve and something that people really want and need. 

James Robert Lay: 
AQ must be greater than IQ. Like a person's adaptability quo9ent must be greater than a person's 
intelligence in this world. Because to that point, what you guys are providing, an individual, a human 
being would never be able to do to crunch all of this data and then to provide recommenda9ons but 
you're empowering the financial brand to further empower people. Final thoughts from you, Seth. 

Seth Fenster: 
Yeah, I would just add, I echo everything Mike said, but I would just add that it would be very helpful to 
stop thinking that you can't do something just because historically it was challenging or difficult and that 
it might be, hard to do financial services digitally and maybe there are some aspects that's true, but for 
the most part, we can make it happen and we'll work with any financial brand that wants to do this. And 
we know every ins9tu9on is unique, every situa9on is unique. 

Seth Fenster: 
But we're working on a plamorm really that can be used by any ins9tu9on, any financial brand, because 
we know the power of what this unlocks and ul9mately at the end of the day, it's about making it 
happen and actually execu9ng it so that all of those bills are actually turned into the opportuni9es that 
we know they are. And it really just kind of starts with the mindset of like, "We can do this. Our 
ins9tu9on can change, it should change and we're going to make it happen." And as long as you have 
that mindset companies like Blip, we're going to work with you and we're going to make it happen. 

James Robert Lay: 
Yes. When you put the transforma9on of account holders over the commodi9zed transac9on of dollars 
and cents, that's when real transforma9on happens and, and what beger 9me than now to really make 
that commitment because money is stressful. That stress is taking a toll on people's health, their 
rela9onships, their overall sense of wellbeing. And the opportunity that I see in this post COVID world is 
for financial brands to commit, to guide people beyond that financial stress towards a bigger, beger and 
brighter future. And I appreciate the important and meaningful work that you guys, that you two 



 

Michael and Seth are doing at Blip. It's been such a great conversa9on, if anyone's listening and they 
have follow-up ques9ons, they want to connect, they want to con9nue the conversa9on with you. 
What's the best way for them to reach out and say hello? 

Seth Fenster: 
Twiger is great. Either @BlipLabs on Twiger or Seth TJF for me. We can set up an email from there, 
phone call or anything. Always happy to chat. 

James Robert Lay: 
Awesome. Thank you. 

Michael Bank: 
We are across all the social plamorms and our website, tryblip.com as well [inaudible 00:32:28]. 

Seth Fenster: 
Yeah. You can drop a note in there and we'll find you 

James Robert Lay: 
Excellent. Michael, Seth, thanks for joining me on another episode of Banking on Digital Growth as 
always, and un9l next 9me be well, do good and wash your hands. 


